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NOTES

More advantage: (since we like shop talk!)

●  Acquisitions, buy sell, trade, lease, exchange and deploy machinery, good to have.

●  Business transactions may be direct or indirectly with a business unit/enterprise, options.

●   Machinery acquisition may be from contributors, non-financial investment contributions, 
assets in trust, by mutual agreement or a conditional sales or acquisitions contract, for those 
that prefer not to “transfer” assets or place them in trust, or other trade, exchange, conversion 
options, and may be re-deployed to a designated company or specific production unit. How is 
that for creative flexibility?  This is all good, since under utilized, extra equipment or stuff that 
needs a good home dedicated to a noble cause, are all things possible with these accounts, 
in addition to the dedicated and focused account for doing the right thing at the right time in 
the right way, all to achieve the right results. Poof!

●  There are specific items not listed here, however, demand for financing, investment, 
acquisition, trade, asset protection, asset deployment with deal making flexibility are all part of 
this portfolio. Price tag can vary depending on the machine type, condition and features.

●  THE ETMO Account is for faster acquisition timelines. The TMDP Account is for strategic 
endeavours, with short, middle and longer acquisition timelines and can be accelerated  with 
special orders, production runs and special RSVP options and logistics that go zapp!

●  Surveys are en route, in addition to more comprehensive general and specific offers and 
requests for this portfolio for a more pro-active and market driven responsive capacity. The 
basic idea of get equipped and get working is expanded upon in greater detail, planning, 
operational capability and strategy.  And, yes, some machinery is worth a whole lot more that 
that fancy car you see outside, and can make a lot of production, precision and profits!

●  Additional combinations of revenue stream generation, financing or provision of machinery 
in one form or another are enabled to provide or supply a diverse range of enterprise and 
Member/Co-trustee requirements in a convenient and efficient manner. If you can't do the 
work yourself, utilize the machinery portfolio available through these accounts, so everyone 
benefits with an increased quality of life and that's great news for Canada!

●  Special Promotions and Compensation are always under development, as our ability to 
have machinery in advance or with a short acquisition lead time for the ETMO Account, 
announcement may vary, and members who can be updated automatically. 

●  We really are excited about machinery in general, especially the  Tools & Machinery 
Development Program Account, that is dedicated to the re-establishment of a very necessary 
industry in Canada. With the right resources and people we can get this going quickly and 
profitably as there are large markets plus, the outlook for creating solid, good paying jobs, 
generate a long lasting top quality high performance machine that has the red and white 
Made in Canada sticker on it looks really great! Put that in your portfolio!

© 2023 Capital Vault Incorporated https://www.capital-vault.ca F: [ETMO_TMDP_Notes]   P: 1/1

https://www.capital-vault.ca/

